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Introduction

On 23 December 2010, the European Union 
(EU) ratified the United Nations Convention 
on the Rights of Persons with Disabilities 
(CRPD). It is the first time in its history that 
the EU has become a party to an international 
human rights treaty.2 The CRPD was ratified 
just weeks after the European Commission 
published the European Disability Strategy 
2010-2020 which sets out a detailed pro-
gramme of action to empower people with 
disabilities so that they can enjoy their rights, 
and benefit fully from participating in society 
and in the European economy. 3 

Ratification means that the EU is now bound 
to ensure that the rights of persons with dis-
abilities are respected, protected and ful-
filled. It also mirrors the obligations of the 
16 member states of the European Union 
that have ratified the CRPD and the remain-
ing 11 that have signed it.4 Since 2000, the 
EU has taken on an important role in setting 
down minimum standards with respect to 
disability discrimination law within member 
states. Alongside this, the European Court 
of Human Rights (ECtHR) has very recently 
handed down decisions which have broad-
ened the scope of protection for persons with 
disabilities within the Council of Europe’s 
borders. Yet, there are many issues relating 
to disability discrimination which are under-
developed in comparison to other grounds of 
discrimination. This article, therefore, aims 
to examine some of the recent developments 
in relation to disability discrimination law 

in Europe and explore the potential of the 
CRPD to improve equality outcomes for per-
sons with disabilities. 

Although some progress has been made to 
introduce legal safeguards to overcome dis-
crimination against disabled people, part 
one of this article indicates that discrimina-
tion and intolerance are still widespread. 
Part two looks at the CRPD and highlights 
some of the key provisions for overcoming 
disabled persons’ inequality. Finally, part 
three discusses the recent developments in 
European (both the EU and the Council of 
Europe) law and policy, and appraises the 
(potential) influence of the CRPD on regional 
mechanisms.

1. Discrimination and Intolerance against 
Persons with Disabilities in Europe

In the EU, one in six people - around 80 mil-
lion - has a disability that ranges from mild to 
severe.5 According to the Council of Europe 
Commissioner for Human Rights, this figure 
within the Council of Europe member states 
is between 10 and 15 percent of the popula-
tion, i.e. between 80 and 120 million people.6 
The wide range of impairments that fall with-
in the term “disability” make the definition 
far broader than that applying to any other 
vulnerable group. Persons with disabilities 
include persons with physical, mental,7 intel-
lectual8 and sensory impairments. It is note-
worthy that protection from discrimination 
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on grounds of disability is also often extend-
ed to persons living with medical conditions 
such as HIV/AIDS or diabetes on the basis of 
the discrimination which such persons are 
likely to experience following their diagno-
sis.9 

While many disabled people may experience 
similar discriminatory treatment, the causes 
of disadvantage differ and depend on their 
individual impairment. For example, issues 
affecting the equality outcomes for a person 
who has schizophrenia may differ entirely to 
the issues that affect the equality outcomes 
for persons living with HIV/AIDS or those 
who have lost a limb or a sensory function. 
In light of this, the human rights definition of 
persons with disabilities contained in Article 
1 of the CRPD offers a holistic approach to 
defining disability. Article 1 provides that: 

“Persons with disabilities include 
those who have long-term physical, mental, 
intellectual or sensory impairments which in 
interaction with various barriers may hinder 
their full and effective participation in soci-
ety on an equal basis with others.” 

The definition in Article 1 moves away from 
the historically dominant medical model of 
disability and towards the social model un-
derstanding of disability. In this understand-
ing, “disabled people experience disability 
as a social restriction, whether those restric-
tions occur as a consequence of inaccessibly 
built environments, questionable notions of 
intelligence and social competence, the in-
ability of the general population to use sign 
language, the lack of reading material in 
Braille or hostile public attitudes to people 
with non-visual disabilities”.10

A definition which is based on the individu-
al experience is more capable of accurately 
framing discussions which are relevant to 

disabled people, identifying hidden sources 
of discrimination and improving our under-
standing of human rights.11 As a result of de-
fining disability in a way that takes into con-
sideration the impairment of the individual 
and the barriers that hinder their social par-
ticipation (for example, environmental, built 
or human barriers), Article 1 of CRPD entitles 
a broad range of people who are vulnerable 
to discrimination on grounds of disability to 
protection.    

Disability discrimination is a historical lega-
cy which is ingrained in the fabric of all soci-
eties.12 In Europe, this legacy is reflected in 
the continued acceptance of many practices 
that acutely discriminate against persons 
with disabilities. Persons with disabilities 
are often assumed to be incapable of under-
taking productive work, attending schools 
on a level playing field with children without 
disabilities, or make active contributions to 
their communities, and often discussions on 
developing equalising measures for persons 
with disabilities are underpinned by such 
assumptions. According to the International 
Labour Organisation, in Europe, a person 
with a disability aged between 16 and 64 has 
a 66% chance of finding a job; this rate falls 
to 47% for a moderately disabled person and 
25% for a person with a severe disability.13 
Further, inequality is not restricted to sectors 
such as employment. The European Union 
Fundamental Rights Agency has recently 
concluded that in 17 out of 27 EU member 
states, persons with mental health problems 
and persons with intellectual disabilities are 
excluded from political participation or are 
only permitted limited political participa-
tion.14

Another significant problem is the failure of 
persons without disabilities to consult or in-
volve persons with disabilities in making de-
cisions that have far-reaching consequences 
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for the latter. Since 2008, Thomas Hammar-
berg, the Council of Europe's Commissioner 
for Human Rights, has voiced concerns about 
the treatment of persons with disabilities on 
three separate occasions.15 In 2009, he iden-
tified the need for greater action:

“During missions to Council of Eu-
rope member states I have had to conclude 
that persons with intellectual disabilities are 
still stigmatised and marginalised; that they 
are rarely consulted or even listened to; that 
a great number of them continue to be kept 
in old-style, inhuman institutions; and that 
moves to provide housing and other services 
in community-based settings have met ob-
stacles and been delayed.”16

Yet symptoms of disability discrimination 
such as stigma, stereotyping and prejudice 
are still common and corrosive influences 
which marginalise persons with disabilities. 
These symptoms stifle clear and construc-
tive thought about how processes and pro-
cedures could be made more accessible and 
inclusive for disabled people. For example, in 
many European countries disabled persons 
are marginalised from political and legal 
decision-making processes because of the 
historical perception that they do not have 
the capacity to be involved and actively par-
ticipate.17 

Of deeper concern is the stigma and preju-
dice which is frequently formalised in policy, 
resulting in egregious human rights viola-
tions against persons with disabilities in 
some countries. In the recent past, the Eu-
ropean Committee on Social Rights has con-
demned the practice of segregating children 
with intellectual disabilities in educational 
institutions in France18 and Bulgaria.19 There 
has also been widespread media attention 
in the United Kingdom in respect to violent 
attacks on persons with learning disabili-

ties. In one widely reported case, a 64 year 
old man suffering from mental and learn-
ing difficulties died of a heart attack after 
being harassed and verbally abused by two 
youths in Manchester.20 This case is not an 
isolated event. Instead, it represents a trend 
which demonstrates that intolerance toward 
disabled persons is growing and becoming 
more visible. One reason for this trend may 
be that violence against persons with dis-
abilities is ignored, underestimated or mis-
understood. The latest hate crimes report 
by the Organisation for Security and Coop-
eration in Europe (OSCE), which states that 
only nine European countries reported to the 
OSCE that they recorded any data on crimes 
against persons with disabilities, suggests 
that underreporting is a significant barrier 
too.21 Consequently, the contention that ig-
norance or misunderstanding of the issue is 
a dominant factor which causes widespread 
discrimination must be matched with the 
fact that there is also a lack of effective moni-
toring and reporting of attacks.

2. The Unique Challenge of Disability and 
the UN Convention on the Rights of Per-
sons with Disabilities 

The CRPD was adopted in 2006 and entered 
into force in 2008. Its purpose is to promote, 
protect and ensure the full and equal enjoy-
ment of all human rights and fundamental 
freedoms by all persons with disabilities.22 
It was the most rapidly negotiated human 
rights treaty to date23 and, since its adoption, 
it has received impressive support globally.24 
Disabled people and disability organisations 
were key participants in influencing and 
drafting the CRPD.25 This influence is visible 
not merely through the broad range of sub-
stantive rights the CRPD guarantees, includ-
ing both civil and political rights26 and socio-
economic rights,27 but also through the pro-
cedures it puts in place for mechanisms such 
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as monitoring.28 Taking into consideration 
the scope of discrimination against persons 
with disabilities, we should highlight some of 
the CRPD’s key provisions that will be impor-
tant for combating disability discrimination 
throughout Europe. 

2.1 Consultation and Involvement 

As discussed above, ignorance and misper-
ceptions about the capabilities of persons 
with disabilities have propagated their ex-
clusion from many areas of life in European 
societies. Lacking effective avenues of con-
sultation or involvement, persons with dis-
abilities are often denied the opportunity 
of participating in public decision-making 
processes and shaping key policy issues. The 
CRPD requires consultation and involvement 
through Article 4(3):

“In the development and implemen-
tation of legislation and policies to imple-
ment the present Convention, and in other 
decision-making processes concerning is-
sues relating to persons with disabilities, 
States Parties shall closely consult with and 
actively involve persons with disabilities, 
including children with disabilities, through 
their representative organisations.”   

Article 4(3) of the CRPD provides that mean-
ingful consultation with and involvement of 
people with disabilities needs to be the start-
ing point to developing legislation and policy 
to implement the Convention. Such consulta-
tion and involvement are crucial for creating 
laws and policies relating to disability issues. 
Indeed, even in respect to laws or policies 
that do not relate to disability issues, con-
sultation mechanisms should aim to capture 
and reflect disabled peoples’ views. Without 
effective consultation and involvement, per-
sons with disabilities will inevitably be bur-
dened with laws and procedures that do not 

account for their individual experiences and 
that reproduce the paternalistic approach 
that has sustained historic disadvantage. For 
many law and policy makers, the principle of 
consultation and inclusion raises concerns 
about communication and sensitivity (not to 
mention funding); however, unless serious 
consultation and involvement procedures are 
ingrained into law and policy development 
processes, either through the direct partici-
pation of persons with disabilities or indi-
rectly through representative organisations, 
effective equality will never be achieved. 

2.2 Reasonable Accommodation
 
Article 5(3) of the CRPD requires State Par-
ties to take all appropriate steps to ensure 
that reasonable accommodation is provided 
for persons with disabilities in order to pro-
mote equality and eliminate discrimination. 
The CRPD also specifically requires that State 
Parties provide reasonable accommodation 
in respect to the right to liberty and security 
of the person,29 the right to education30 and 
the right to work and employment.31 Reason-
able accommodation is defined in Article 2 of 
the CRPD as follows:

“ ‘Reasonable  accommodation’ 
means necessary and appropriate modifica-
tion and adjustments not imposing a dispro-
portionate or undue burden, where needed 
in a particular case, to ensure to persons 
with disabilities the enjoyment or exercise 
on an equal basis with others of all human 
rights and fundamental freedoms.”

This definition is similar to but stronger and 
more far-reaching than the definition con-
tained in Article 5 of the Council Directive 
2000/78/EC of 27 November 2000, which, 
within the context of employment and occu-
pation, requires that: 



The Equal Rights Review, Vol. Six  (2011)

15

“[E]mployers shall take appropri-
ate measures, where needed in a particular 
case, to enable a person with a disability to 
have access to, participate in, or advance in 
employment, or to undergo training, unless 
such measures would impose a dispropor-
tionate burden on the employer”. 32

Although many states within the EU will 
have in place provisions to provide reason-
able accommodation in employment and oc-
cupation, Article 5(3) of the CRPD creates a 
stronger and broader requirement. States 
Parties must take all appropriate reasonable 
accommodation steps to promote equality in 
the enjoyment and exercise by persons with 
disabilities of all human rights. In order to 
comply with the CRPD, States Parties bound 
by the Council Directive will now have to ex-
pand their legal provisions relating to rea-
sonable accommodation for people with dis-
abilities to cover areas outside employment 
and occupation.33 

2.3 Legal Capacity

Article 12 is one of the most difficult but in-
teresting and innovative aspects of the CRPD. 
Article 12 provides that: 

“1. States Parties reaffirm that per-
sons with disabilities have the right to rec-
ognition everywhere as persons before the 
law.

2. States Parties shall recognise that persons 
with disabilities enjoy legal capacity on an 
equal basis with others in all aspects of life.

3. States Parties shall take appropriate mea-
sures to provide access by persons with dis-
abilities to the support they may require in 
exercising their legal capacity.

4. States Parties shall ensure that all mea-
sures that relate to the exercise of legal ca-
pacity provide for appropriate and effective 
safeguards to prevent abuse in accordance 
with international human rights law. Such 
safeguards shall ensure that measures relat-
ing to the exercise of legal capacity respect 
the rights, will and preferences of the person, 
are free of conflict of interest and undue in-
fluence, are proportional and tailored to the 
person's circumstances, apply for the short-
est time possible and are subject to regular 
review by a competent, independent and im-
partial authority or judicial body. The safe-
guards shall be proportional to the degree 
to which such measures affect the person's 
rights and interests.”

Article 12 of the CRPD has a great potential 
to create positive change. The fact that many 
states continue to deny or restrict the legal 
capacity of persons with intellectual difficul-
ties through court action is very problemat-
ic.34 It has led to the restriction of basic rights 
without justification or review. For example, 
as the European Union Fundamental Rights 
Agency has reported, the majority of Euro-
pean Union Member States link the right to 
political participation to the legal capacity 
of the individual.35 In view of the impact that 
the restriction of legal capacity can have on a 
person’s exercise of their human rights, two 
questions are of central importance to un-
derstanding the scope of Article 12:

  (1)	 Does Article 12 require States Parties 
to grant all persons with disabilities the legal 
capacity to act even where they are consid-
ered to lack capacity? 

  (2)	 If so, would this increase the risk of 
some persons with disabilities being vulner-
able to people who would take advantage of 
their lack of capacity? 
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Paragraphs 3 and 4 of Article 12 provide 
guidance on these questions. Article 12(3) 
requires that states must put in place appro-
priate measures which support persons with 
disabilities in exercising their legal capacity; 
thus it is plain that Article 12 applies to all 
persons with disabilities regardless of the 
form of disability.36 In cases of severe men-
tal or intellectual impairment, appropriate 
measures may include electing a personal 
representative to support the person in tak-
ing decisions and exercising their legal ca-
pacity. Further, Article 12(4) provides that in 
such cases safeguards must be put in place to 
prevent abuse occurring within the exercise 
of legal capacity. So Article 12 requires State 
Parties to engage with the legal capacity is-
sue positively by leaning toward supportive 
inclusion rather than automatic exclusion. As 
Gerard Quinn has commented:

“[I]ncapacity is not really a black 
and white issue, it is very much an individu-
alised process. The first thing that a political 
authority should look to do is to put in the 
supports to enable individuals to make deci-
sions, rather than take away this opportunity 
and do the easier thing of letting another 
person make the decision for them.”37

Therefore, Article 12 confronts the percep-
tion that persons with incapacity should not 
have a right to take decisions that may have a 
substantial effect on their lives. This, accord-
ing to Gabor Gambos: 

	 “[G]oes against a 2000 year old deep-
rooted prejudice-based paradigm which says 
that there are people who are so disabled in 
their cognitive decision-making functions that 
they cannot exercise their autonomy, or their 
right to make their own choices, and that this 
right should be delegated to another person 
who will make decisions on their behalf”.38

The right to recognition everywhere as per-
sons before the law required by Article 12(1) 
challenges the historical legacy of pervasive 
stereotyping, prejudice and stigma which 
has caused discrimination against disabled 
people. What is more, acting in combina-
tion with other provisions of the CRPD, for 
example Article 29,39 Article 12 has the po-
tential to play an instructive role in guiding 
legal reform and policy development. Article 
12 offers a concrete set of standards which 
remoulds the relationship that persons with 
disabilities have with society by sending a 
clear message that persons with disabilities 
“enjoy legal capacity on an equal basis with 
others in all aspects of life”. 

2.4 Violence and Abuse

Violence against persons with disabilities is 
an often overlooked issue when developing 
legal and policy measures to promote full 
and effective equality. Article 16 of the CRPD 
requires states to: 

	 “[T]ake all appropriate legislative, 
administrative, social, educational and other 
measures to protect persons with disabili-
ties, both within and outside the home, from 
all forms of exploitation, violence and abuse, 
including their gender-based aspects;40 (…) 
take all appropriate measures to prevent all 
forms of exploitation, violence and abuse 
by ensuring, inter alia, appropriate forms 
of gender- and age-sensitive assistance and 
support for persons with disabilities and 
their families and caregivers;41 (…) put in 
place effective legislation and policies (...) 
to ensure that instances of exploitation, vio-
lence and abuse against persons with dis-
abilities are identified, investigated and (...) 
prosecuted42.”
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The need for strong legal provisions, includ-
ing a severe judicial response and enhanced 
penalties for hate crimes on a range of 
grounds including disability, has been iden-
tified by the Council of Europe’s Commis-
sioner for Human Rights.43 Without effective 
provisions which require state authorities 
to prevent, prioritise and prosecute the vio-
lence and abuse targeted at persons with dis-
abilities, efforts to document and report hate 
crimes are likely to fail. In several European 
countries, there are no laws in place which 
deal with aggravated offences on the grounds 
of disability and it appears that relatively 
few countries keep records of such crimes. 
In countries that have adopted such laws, for 
example the United Kingdom, it appears that 
both the reporting of these crimes and the 
rate of prosecution for reported crimes have 
been low.44 Article 16 of the CRPD strength-
ens this area of disability equality law by 
placing strong obligations on States Parties 
to adopt law and policy measures aimed at 
protecting the safety of persons with disabil-
ities. While adoption of legislation is an im-
portant first step, such laws require targeted 
awareness-raising campaigns to ensure that 
victims know their rights, understand the 
procedures for reporting abuse and violence 
and are comfortable in coming forward to re-
port when they have been a victim of a crime. 
Alongside this, training and awareness-rais-
ing within the judiciary and law enforcement 
authorities would benefit victims with dis-
abilities who report crimes in getting a fair 
shake within the criminal justice system. 
Part of the reason for the underreporting of 
violent attacks against persons with disabili-
ties may be because there is an uncertainty 
among law enforcement authorities about 
how to deal with victims who have disabili-
ties and are unable to express their experi-
ences in a similar way to victims without dis-
abilities. Consequently, when implementing 

measures to protect persons with disabilities 
from violence and abuse, it is extremely im-
portant that training and awareness-raising 
measures among law enforcement officials 
are also put in place so that persons with dis-
abilities can report crimes in a comfortable 
and sensitive environment which enables 
them to communicate their experiences ef-
fectively. 

Law and policy development for some prob-
lematic issues, for example consultation or 
violence/hate crimes, can benefit from the 
lessons learnt during the successful imple-
mentation of mechanisms and safeguards 
in relation to discrimination on grounds of 
race or sex. Communication with some per-
sons with disabilities remains a key issue in 
some areas. Therefore, it is important that 
processes are created which provide effec-
tive communication pathways for persons 
with disabilities. Other issues, for example, 
legal capacity and reasonable accommoda-
tion, are either unique to disability or have 
been traditionally perceived as disability is-
sues. As such, they present greater practical 
and conceptual difficulties to law and policy 
makers. However, the CRPD sets clear and in-
structive standards which bind State Parties 
to adopt measures that improve the equality 
outcomes for persons with disabilities.

3. The Potential Impact of the CRPD on 
European Law and Policy

3.1 The European Union

Anti-discrimination law in respect to disabil-
ity was introduced in the European Union 
through the Council Directive 2000/78/EC 
of 27 November 2000 establishing a general 
framework for equal treatment in employ-
ment and occupation.45 This Directive pro-
hibited the direct and indirect discrimina-
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tion, harassment and instruction to discrimi-
nate against disabled persons in the field 
of employment and occupation. In its early 
jurisprudence, the Court of Justice of the Eu-
ropean Communities (ECJ) lent towards a 
medical definition of disability. Disability, the 
ECJ explained:

“[M]ust be understood as referring 
to a limitation which results in particular 
from physical, mental or psychological im-
pairments and which hinders the participa-
tion of the person concerned in professional 
life. (…) However, by using the concept of 
‘disability’ in Article 1 of that directive, the 
legislature deliberately chose a term which 
differs from ‘sickness’. The two concepts can-
not therefore simply be treated as being the 
same.”46 

Later jurisprudence has interpreted pro-
tection from discrimination on the ground 
of disability to include protection from dis-
crimination by association on the ground of 
disability.47 The practical implication of this 
decision is that now if persons without dis-
abilities are discriminated against because of 
an association with a person with a disability 
- for example, a mother with caring respon-
sibilities for her child who has a disability - 
they will be protected from discrimination 
under Article 2(a) of the Council Directive. 
The justification for this interpretation was 
made in the opinion of Advocate General 
Poiares Maduro:

“As stated, the effect of the Directive 
is that it is impermissible for an employer 
to rely on religion, age, disability and sexual 
orientation in order to treat some employees 
less well than others. To do so would amount 
to subjecting these individuals to unjust 
treatment and failing to respect their dignity 
and autonomy. This fact does not change in 

cases where the employee who is the object 
of discrimination is not disabled herself. The 
ground which serves as the basis of the dis-
crimination she suffers continues to be dis-
ability. The Directive operates at the level 
of grounds of discrimination. The wrong 
that it was intended to remedy is the use 
of certain characteristics as grounds to 
treat some employees less well than oth-
ers; what it does is to remove religion, 
age, disability and sexual orientation 
completely from the range of grounds an 
employer may legitimately use to treat 
some people less well. Put differently, the 
Directive does not allow the hostility an em-
ployer may have against people belonging 
to the enumerated suspect classifications to 
function as the basis for any kind of less fa-
vourable treatment in the context of employ-
ment and occupation.”48 (Emphasis added.)

Although the ECJ’s early interpretation of 
disability received some criticism for be-
ing overly medial, recent jurisprudence has 
grappled with key concepts and concerns for 
persons with disabilities in a progressive and 
welcome manner. 

But what impact could the EU’s ratification 
of the CRPD have on the jurisprudence of the 
ECJ? In Mangold v Helm the ECJ referred to: 

“[T]he source of the actual principle 
underlying the prohibition of those forms of 
discrimination [on the grounds of religion or 
belief, disability, age or sexual orientation] 
being found, as is clear from the third and 
fourth recitals in the preamble to the direc-
tive, in various international instruments 
and in the constitutional traditions common 
to the Member States”.49 

Recital 4 of the Council Directive provides 
that the right of all persons to equality be-
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fore the law and protection against discrimi-
nation: 

“[C]onstitutes a universal right rec-
ognised by the Universal Declaration of Hu-
man Rights, the United Nations Convention 
on the Elimination of All Forms of Discrimi-
nation Against Women, the International 
Convention on the Elimination of all Forms 
of Racial Discrimination and the United Na-
tions Covenants on Civil and Political Rights 
and on Economic, Social and Cultural Rights 
and by the European Convention for the Pro-
tection of Human Rights and Fundamental 
Freedoms, to which all Member States are 
signatories”. 

The implication of ratifying the CRPD is that 
it must be read into Recital 4 of the Council 
Directive by the EU organs, including the ECJ. 
Therefore, the CRPD will form part of the 
foundation of the universal right to equality 
before the law and protection against dis-
crimination. On this basis, the ECJ must seek 
consistency with the CRPD. In addition, with 
the entry into force of the Charter of Funda-
mental Rights of the European Union, the ECJ 
may be aided by the provisions of the CRPD 
in interpreting the scope of Article 2150 and 
Article 2651 of the Charter. 

In relation to EU policy, the CRPD has had a 
major influence on the content of the Euro-
pean Disability Strategy 2010-2020.52 The 
European Commission justified much of the 
strategy as necessary to effectively imple-
ment the CRPD in Europe and create con-
sistency in EU disability policy. The strategy 
includes eight action points where EU level 
policy harmonisation is necessary.53 Guided 
by the CRPD, the EU has undertaken to sup-
port and supplement national initiatives to 
implement the requirements of the CRPD 
through strategic action, including:

▪	 Supporting and supplementing national 
policies and programmes to promote equal-
ity, for instance by promoting the conformity 
of Member State legislation on legal capacity 
with the CRPD; and

▪	 Working where appropriate within a 
broader framework of non-discrimination to 
highlight disability as a human rights issue 
in the EU’s external action; raising aware-
ness of the CRPD and the needs of people 
with disabilities, including accessibility, in 
the area of emergency and humanitarian aid; 
consolidating the network of disability cor-
respondents; increasing awareness of dis-
ability issues in EU delegations; ensuring 
that candidate and potential candidate coun-
tries make progress in promoting the rights 
of people with disabilities.

In order to fully comply with the require-
ments of the CRPD, the EU will have to pass 
additional legislation to support Council Di-
rective 2000/78/EC. Therefore, it is likely 
that the CRPD will provide the needed mo-
mentum for adopting a new anti-discrimina-
tion directive that would harmonise protec-
tion from discrimination on grounds of dis-
ability (and age, religion, sex, and sexual ori-
entation) to the standards afforded to race. 
Given the commitment in Article 6(1) of the 
CRPD to combating multiple discrimination, 
the adoption of a new anti-discrimination 
directive seems to be the necessary starting 
point.

3.2 The Council of Europe

The European Court of Human Rights 
(ECtHR) has set an example which the ECJ 
should look to follow in respect to the CRPD. 
Benefitting from the standards contained in 
the CRPD, the ECtHR has pushed the issue of 
discrimination and intolerance against per-
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sons with disabilities into focus in Strasbourg 
in two recent cases. In Glor v Switzerland,54 
the applicant, Swiss national Sven Glor, was 
deemed medically unfit to perform military 
service due to his diabetes. According to 
the Swiss authorities, his condition posed a 
problem on account of the particular restric-
tions related to military service including the 
limited access to medical care and medica-
tion, the significant physical efforts required 
and the psychological pressure exerted on 
military personnel. However, the authori-
ties decided that Mr Glor’s diabetes was not 
severe enough to relieve him from paying a 
non-negligible military service exemption 
tax on his annual earnings for several years. 
As a result, Mr Glor argued that he had been 
subjected to discrimination on the basis of 
his disability, contrary to Article 14 together 
with Article 8 of the European Convention on 
Human Rights (ECHR), because he had been 
prohibited from carrying out his military 
service, and was obliged to pay the exemp-
tion tax as his disability was judged not to be 
severe enough for him to forgo the tax.

While Article 14 of the ECHR contains an 
“other status” clause whereby a non-listed 
ground could be read into the right to non-
discrimination, prior to Glor v Switzerland 
the ECtHR had never before found a violation 
of the right to non-discrimination on the ba-
sis of disability. It is also significant that the 
ECtHR concluded that diabetes constituted a 
disability. In handing down its decision, the 
ECtHR condemned disability discrimination 
committed by the Swiss authorities through 
failing to provide reasonable accommoda-
tion to Mr Glor by finding a solution which 
responded to his individual circumstances. 
The judgment is also praiseworthy for noting 
that the CRPD signalled the existence of a Eu-
ropean and universal consensus on the need 
to protect persons with disabilities from dis-

criminatory treatment. This note was made 
in spite of the fact that Switzerland had not 
signed the CRPD.

The ECtHR built on the Glor decision in its 
2010 judgment of Alajos Kiss v Hungary.55 The 
applicant in this case suffered from manic de-
pression and had for that reason been placed 
under partial guardianship. The Hungarian 
Constitution contained an absolute voting 
ban for people put under guardianship. Con-
sequently, the applicant could not vote in the 
2006 parliamentary elections. The ECtHR 
held unanimously that such an absolute ban 
violated the right to free elections of Article 
3 of Protocol 1 ECHR. In reaching its decision 
the court stated:

“The Court further considers that 
the treatment as a single class of those with 
intellectual or mental disabilities is a ques-
tionable classification and the curtailment 
of their rights must be subject to strict 
scrutiny. This approach is reflected in other 
instruments of international law (…). The 
Court therefore concludes that an indiscrim-
inate removal of voting rights, without an 
individualised judicial evaluation and solely 
based on a mental disability necessitating 
partial guardianship, cannot be considered 
compatible with the legitimate grounds for 
restricting the right to vote.”56 (Emphasis 
added.)

By stating that the curtailment of the rights 
of persons with intellectual or mental dis-
abilities must be subject to strict scrutiny, 
the ECtHR indicated that a very high thresh-
old must be met in order for it to be justified. 
Past decisions of the ECtHR have used this 
level of scrutiny in limited circumstances 
which apply to distinctions made on grounds 
such as race or sex.57 The CRPD was a corner-
stone of the ECtHR’s finding that the same 
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level of scrutiny should be used to assess dis-
tinctions made on the ground of disability.58   

The strength of the ECtHR’s case law on dis-
crimination and intolerance against persons 
with disabilities will surely be tested in the 
near future. For example, the record of in-
terpreting the ECHR consistently with the 
standards contained in the CRPD is likely to 
be tested in the forthcoming case of Kiyutin v 
Russia.59 In this case, the applicant is a nation-
al of Uzbekistan who lives in the Oryol region 
of Russia. He is married to a Russian national 
with whom he has a young child. Mr Kiyutin’s 
application for a residence permit was how-
ever rejected by the Russian authorities on 
account of his HIV-positive status. According 
to Russia’s Law on the Legal Status of Foreign 
Nationals, foreigners wishing to stay in the 
country long-term must demonstrate that 
they are HIV-negative. In his application to 
the ECtHR, Mr Kiyutin has argued that the re-
jection of his application for a residency per-
mit violates his right to respect for his family 
life as well as his right to non-discrimination 
on the basis of HIV status (Article 14 of the 
ECHR in conjunction with Article 8). NGOs 
intervening in the case have argued that the 
right to equality and non-discrimination, set 
out in Article 5 of the CRPD, protects persons 
living with HIV/AIDS.60 If the ECtHR accepts 
the applicant’s position, it will represent not 
only a forceful use of the CRPD to interpret 
the ECHR but it will also open up an added 
dimension by protecting persons living with 
HIV/AIDS through the right to non-discrimi-
nation on grounds of disability. 

It is unsurprising that the recent strengthen-
ing of ECHR jurisprudence in respect to dis-
ability has occurred shortly after the entry 
into force of the CRPD. A significant number 
of the countries which are bound by the ECHR 
are also parties to the CRPD and there ap-

pears to be an overarching consensus among 
these countries that disability rights must 
be promoted, protected and fulfilled. Admit-
tedly, at times the ECtHR plays the role of a 
consensus-builder in reaching its decisions.61 
Hopefully, now that a consensus already ex-
ists around the CRPD, the ECtHR will be in a 
better position when calling to order states 
that discriminate against persons with dis-
ability and violate their basic human rights.

In its short lifetime, the CRPD has already 
added an extremely important new dimen-
sion to the fight against discrimination on 
grounds of disability in Europe. It has con-
solidated legal concepts such as reasonable 
accommodation, guided the jurisprudence of 
the ECtHR and energised European countries 
to develop new safeguards and measures to 
entrench disability rights and promote ef-
fective equality for persons with disabilities. 
Whether the ECJ will follow the example of 
the ECtHR and take into consideration the 
CRPD when handing down decisions on 
disability-related issues is yet to be tested. 
However, in light of the increased protection 
from discrimination and the promotion of 
equality on the ground of disability required 
by the Charter of Fundamental Rights of the 
European Union, one would expect that the 
CRPD would be a natural source of guidance.

Conclusion

The CRPD has been described as “a para-
digm shift” in relation to how human rights 
are to be understood in the 21st century.62 
This would be a significant burden to bear 
for any piece of international law, let alone 
a law which protects the rights of individu-
als who have for so long been overlooked in 
society. Yet in the short period since its en-
try into force, the impact of the CRPD offers 
much promise. 
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In Europe, it has been accepted almost uni-
versally that there is a need for strong human 
rights protection for persons with disabili-
ties. The CRPD has already begun to shape 
EU policy and ECtHR jurisprudence and in 
many areas it is proving to be a key instru-
ment for promoting law reform and requir-
ing states to re-examine how persons with 
disabilities are perceived. Often it has asked 
fundamental questions of the paternalistic 
welfare policy adopted by most European 
countries towards disabled persons. None-
theless, in Europe paternalistic rhetoric still 
underpins disability law, policy and practice. 
Consequently, these strategic developments 
will only lead to effective equality for persons 
with disabilities in key areas such as educa-
tion, healthcare, criminal justice and political 
participation once the initial enthusiasm and 
goodwill shown to the CRPD is transformed 
through the difficult task of putting in place 
practical solutions for the challenges encoun-
tered by persons with disabilities.

Undoubtedly, a global convention on disabil-
ity was needed due to the large gaps that ex-
isted in national, regional and international 
human rights and non-discrimination pro-
tection. This article has argued that the CRPD 
has started to influence the European Union 
and the Council of Europe mechanisms and 
institutions. But such mechanisms should 
have an impact on law and policy develop-
ment at local levels. At these local levels it 
is clear that discrimination and intolerance 
against persons with disabilities is still per-
vasive throughout Europe. Whether the 
CRPD will be able to fulfil its promise will 
depend on how national authorities grapple 
with complex issues such as legal capacity 
during implementation. In any case, the en-
ergy and vision that the CRPD has imparted 
on the struggle for equality for persons with 
disabilities should not be underestimated. 
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